Sudbury Water District
IFB 26-4
Miscellaneous Waterworks Supplies
Bid Opening: 4/2/2025 @ 10:00 AM

| John Hoadley & Sons | Ti-Sales Putnam Pipe E.J. Prescott
BID GROUP 1
SIZE GATE VALVES ary] M & Mfr UNIT PRICE EXTENDEDBID I Mfr & MfrPartt ;7 ppice | extenpep Bip amount | MTEMTPartl i price  [extenoep eip amount| MT&MTPart] i price | ExTENDED BID AMOUNT
Part # AMOUNT # # #
K Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open
6 Right, Mueller or approved equal: 4 Mueller $934.00 $3,736.00 AVK $1,111.20 $4,444.80 Kennedy $936.11 $3,744.44 AFC $1,066.84 $4,267.36
gr  [Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open 4 I 1,485.00 5940.00]  AVK 1,768.56 $7,074.24] Kenned 1,491.01 s964.04]  AFC 1,697.59 6,790.36
Right, Mueller or approved equal: Mueller $1,485. $5, : $1,768.5 ’ . enneay 1, . S5, . F $1,697.5 S6, .
. Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open
10 Right, Mueller or approved equal: 1 Mueller $2,320.00 $2,320.00 AVK $2,756.82 $2,756.82 Kennedy $2,247.05 $2,247.05 AFC $2,646.44 $2,646.44
. |Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open
12 Right, Mueller or approved equal: 1 Mueller $2,935.00 $2,935.00 AVK $3,488.22 $3,488.22 Kennedy $2,941.88 $2,941.88 AFC $3,348.96 $3,348.96
1gn  [Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open 1| Muel $9,840.00 $9,840.00]  AVK $12,286.24 $12,286.24]  Kenned $9,570.44 $9,570.44]  AFC $10,750.00 $10,750.00
Right, Mueller or approved equal: ueller [ ofFiidh ,£00. ,£00. enneay ,2 /0. ,2 /0. ,750. ,750.
Sub-Total $24,771.00 $30,050.32 $24,467.85 $27,803.12
BID GROUP 2
MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT Mfr & Mfr EXTENDED BID Mfr & Mfr Part Mfr & Mfr Part Mfr & Mfr Part
SIZE PACK FOR D.I. & PVC PIPE Qry| Part # UNIT PRICE AMOUNT # UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT 4 UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT 4 UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
N Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI
6 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 10| Ebaa 2000 $58.00 $580.00 Napac $66.81 $668.10 Sygma $47.81 $478.10 Sygma $63.01 $630.10
B Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI
8 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 10| Ebaa 2001 $77.50 $775.00 Napac $86.91 $869.10 Sygma $65.23 $652.30 Sygma $85.88 $858.80
. |Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI
10 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 8 Ebaa 2002 $110.00 $880.00 Napac $118.79 $950.32 Sygma $88.89 $711.12 Sygma $122.11 $976.88
. |Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI
12 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 4 Ebaa 2003 $146.00 $584.00 Napac $144.77 $579.08 Sygma $124.15 $496.60 Sygma $164.13 $656.52
| Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI
16 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 4 | Ebaa 2004 $245.00 $980.00 Napac $232.58 $930.32 Sygma $208.43 $833.72 Sygma $294.50 $1,178.00
B Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900
6 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 10| Ebaa 2005 $66.75 $667.50 Ford $85.15 $851.50 Sygma $53.55 $535.50 Sygma $83.82 $838.20
B Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900
8 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 10| Ebaa 2006 $89.00 $890.00 Ford $105.14 $1,051.40 Sygma $74.86 $748.60 Sygma $113.54 $1,135.40
| Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900
10 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 8 Ebaa 2007 $151.00 $1,208.00 Ford $147.26 $1,178.08 Sygma $120.88 $967.04 Sygma $196.31 $1,570.48
\ Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900
12 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 4 | Ebaa 2008 $159.00 $636.00 Ford $150.99 $603.96 Sygma $136.75 $547.00 Sygma $206.92 $827.68
. |Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900
16 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 4 | Ebaa 2009 $308.00 $1,232.00 Ford $417.14 $1,668.56 Sygma $261.33 $1,045.32 Sygma $440.35 $1,761.40




| John Hoadley & Sons | Ti-Sales Putnam Pipe E.J. Prescott
BID GROUP 3
SERVICE SADDLES w/ CC Mfr & Mfr EXTENDED BID Mfr & Mfr Part Mfr & Mfr Part Mfr & Mfr Part
SIZE b ar| UNIT PRICE AMOUNT s UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT ) UNITPRICE  |EXTENDED BID AMOUNT 4 UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, E o o ) )
6'x1' | ervice saddie, Single Strap, EPOXY g | goith Blair $155.00 $775.00]  Smith Blair $35.68 $178.40 No Bid No Bid Romac $93.11 $465.55
oated, Romac or approved equal:
CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, E
g'x1 | ervice saddle, Single Strap, Epoxy | o | g i gair $182.00 $910.00]  smith Blair $41.28 $206.40 No Bid No Bid Romac $110.52 $552.60
oated, Romac or approved equal:
CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, £
0x1" | ervice saddle, Single Strap, EPOXY |5 | gy jair $225.00 $450.00]  smith Blair $45.84 $91.68 No Bid No Bid Romac $120.72 $241.44
oated, Romac or approved equal:
CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, E o o ] ]
EAPERN I ervice >addie, SIngie Sap, EOXY 45 1 smith Blair $250.00 $500.00]  smith Blair $53.03 $106.06 No Bid No Bid Romac $139.65 $279.30
oated, Romac or approved equal:
CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, E o ) . o ) .
16"x1" |- ervice >addie, SINgle Sap, EOXY - | smith Blair No Bid No Bid Smith Blair $132.13 $132.13 No Bid No Bid Romac $371.96 $371.96
oated, Romac or approved equal:
Sub-Total $2,635.00 $714.67 No Bid $1,910.85
BID GROUP 4
SIZE POLYETHYLENE (PE) TUBING  |ary Mgai ';:'fr UNIT PRICE EXI\Er\;‘cD)S?J:ID Mfr & ':fr Partl  nmrerice | extenoep eip amount M ':fr Patl  ynmerice  |extenpep sio amount] M & ':fr Partl  Unimerice | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
4 PE Tubing (Per 100" Roll): 2 No Bid No Bid Blue $S0.57 $114.00 Endot $0.41 $82.00 Flying W $47.00 $94.00
1” PE Tubing (Per 100' Roll): 4 No Bid No Bid Blue $0.93 $372.00 Endot $0.68 $272.00 Flying W $77.00 $308.00
Sub-Total $486.00 $354.00 $402.00
BID GROUP 5
SIZE DUCTILE IRON PIPE Qry| LGl £ b4l UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID by &3 L UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT ity £ B3 UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT [Wlte &4 LS UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
Part # AMOUNT Part # Part # Part #
6" Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): | 100 180 Days| S 31.00 $3,100.00 No Bid No Bid US Pipe $29.27 $2,927.00 ACIP $34.01 $3,401.00
8" Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): | 100 S 43.75 $4,375.00 No Bid No Bid US Pipe $41.30 $4,130.00 ACIP $47.99 $4,799.00
10" Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): | 20 S 57.50 $1,150.00 No Bid No Bid US Pipe S54.14 $1,082.80 ACIP $62.89 $1,257.80
12" Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): | 40 S 72.40 $2,896.00 No Bid No Bid US Pipe $68.16 $2,726.40 ACIP $79.21 $3,168.40
16" Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): S 104.50 $2,090.00 No Bid No Bid US Pipe $98.64 $1,972.80 ACIP $114.61 $2,292.20
Sub-Total $13,611.00 No Bid $12,839.00 $14,918.40
BID GROUP 6
P
SIZE OLYVINYL CHLORIDE PVC PIPE f1py| - Mifr & Mir UNIT PRICE EXTENDEDBID I Mir&MfrPartl i price | extenpep sio amount ™M™ & MIPart]  yyirprice  [exrenpe sio avount| MT&MIPartl i price | extenpeD sio AvouNT
(C900) Part # AMOUNT # # #
6" C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $13.25 $1,325.00 IPEX $12.52 $1,252.00
8" C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $22.73 $2,273.00 IPEX $21.49 $2,149.00
10" |C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): 80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $32.36 $2,588.80 IPEX $32.26 $2,580.80
12" |C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): 120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $45.57 $5,468.40 IPEX $45.44 S$5,452.80
16" |C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $115.50 $4,620.00 IPEX $87.53 $3,501.20
| John Hoadley & Sons | Ti-Sales Putnam Pipe E.J. Prescott
BID GROUP 7
SIZE REPAIR COUPLING ary Mgaf‘t “:fr UNIT PRICE Exlwgszf") Mfr & ';’:fr Partl  ynimerice | extenoep eio amount | MT & ':fr Patl  unimerice  |extenpep eio amount] M & '\:fr Partl  unmeRicE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with
6 Lo ot e e ron Soupine Wit 10 | Mueller/Hymax $304.00 $3,040.00] Smith Blair $275.71 $2,757.10]  Ford $324.25 $3,242.50] Romac Macro $354.92 $3,549.20
andle, Hymax 2 or equal:
Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with
g Lo pofl et e ron Soupine Wit 10 | Mueller/Hymax $340.00 $3,400.00] Smith Blair $312.24 $3,122.40]  Ford $366.09 $3,660.90] Romac Macro $400.72 $4,007.20
andle, Hymax 2 or equal:
Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with
1 [0 ot Puet e ron Conpne it 6 | Mueller/Hymax $442.00 $2,652.00] Smith Blair $432.35 $2,504.10)  Ford $460.83 $2,764.98| Romac Macro $515.50 $3,093.00
andle, Hymax 2 or equal:
Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with
1 o O Puct e ron Conping it 6 | Mueller/Hymax $522.00 $3,132.00] Smith Blair $561.73 $337038)  Ford $635.04 $3,810.24] Romac Macro $608.45 $3,650.70
andle, Hymax 2 or equal:
. Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with . .
16 Handle, Hymax 2 or equal: 2 | Mueller/Hymax $1,425.00 $2,850.00f Smith Blair $1,293.46 $2,586.92 Hymax Style $3,232.12 $6,464.24 Romac Macro $1,666.53 $3,333.06




BID GROUP 8
SIZE FULL CIRCLE REAIR CLAMP  |ary Mgai ':fr UNIT PRICE EXLE'\ZICD)SE:ID Mfr & ';:fr Partl  unrerice | extenoep eip amount M “:fr Patl  ynerice  |extenpep eio amount] M & ':fr Part]  UnITeRicE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
12.5" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, o , .
I St 4| smith Blair $113.50 $454.00] Smith Blair $134.13 $536.52 $ 187.70 $750.80]  Romac $276.01 $1,104.04
mith-Blair or equal:
12.5" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, o , .
8" o ot o ar VIAMEEEE L | smith slair $132.00 $792.00] Smith Blair $156.35 $938.10 $ 219.97 $1,319.82]  Romac $325.07 $1,950.42
mith-Blair or equal:
12.5" Qverall Length, Stainless Steel, o , .
wr [ e e s e 4| smithBlair $168.50 $674.00] Smith Blair $179.18 $716.72 $ 286.01 $1,144.04]  Romac $423.49 $1,693.96
mith-Blair or equal:
12.5" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, o , .
1 [ e e RRNEEES L a | smith slair $204.00 $816.00] Smith Blair $205.49 $821.96 $ 343.62 $1,374.48]  Romac $490.78 $1,963.12
mith-Blair or equal:
15" O Il L th, Stainl Steel, X X . .
16" | e o e e 2| smithsiair $297.50 $595.00] Smith Blair $534.33 $1,068.66 $ 687.51 $1,375.02]  Romac $1,412.91 $2,825.82
mith-Blair or equal:
15" O Il L th, Stainl Steel, X X . .
6" o g e RIS 4| smith Blair $125.00 $500.00] Smith Blair $156.40 $625.60 $ 206.88 $827.52]  Romac $304.42 $1,217.68
mith-Blair or equal:
15" O Il L th, Stainl Steel, X X . .
8" o g o b PRI 6 | smith Blair $152.00 $912.00] smith Blair $187.79 $1,126.74 $ 251.45 $1,508.70]  Romac $37147 $2,228.82
mith-Blair or equal:
15" O Il L th, Stainl Steel, X X . .
o | e e e 4| smith Blair $195.00 $780.00] Smith Blair $226.73 $906.92 $ 290.76 $1,163.04]  Romac $486.58 $1,946.32
mith-Blair or equal:
15" O Il L th, Stainl Steel, X X . .
1 | e e e e 4| smith Blair $232.00 $928.00] Smith Blair $252.06 $1,008.24 $ 388.46 $1,553.84]  Romac $554.97 $2,219.88
mith-Blair or equal:
20" O Il L th, Stainl Steel, X X . .
16" | b o e 2| smith Blair $434.00 $868.00] Smith Blair $85292 $1,705.84 $ 944.20 $1,888.40]  Romac $1,877.09 $3,754.18
mith-Blair or equal:
| John Hoadley & Sons I Ti-Sales Putnam Pipe E.J. Prescott
BID GROUP 9
CURB BOX, MAIN GATE VALVE BOX, Mfr & Mfr EXTENDED BID Mfr & Mfr Part Mfr & Mfr Part Mfr & Mfr Part
SIZE AND COVERS an| Mo UNIT PRICE AVOUNT p UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT u UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT u UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
4 Vz;/’:o > Erie Style Curb Box with Centering Rod | 30 | Bingham & Taylor] No Bid No Bid Clow $112.48 $3,374.40 Bibby $70.18 $2,105.40 S 70.50 $2,115.00
6" Curb Box (Erie) Extension: 20 | Bingham & Taylor| No Bid No Bid Clow $39.33 $786.60 Bibby $16.39 $327.80 S 13.76 $275.20
30" |Stainless-Steel Centering Rod: 30 | Bingham & Taylor| No Bid No Bid Clow $41.68 $1,250.40 Bibby $32.76 $982.80 S 18.50 $555.00
Cast | Main Gate Valve B ith
G S 10 | Bingham & Taylor No Bid No Bid Clow $205.72 $2,057.20]  Bibby $239.18 $2,391.80 $ 305.00 $3,050.00
1" Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | Bingham & Taylor No Bid No Bid Clow $23.37 $701.10 Bibby $22.38 $671.40 S 12.75 $382.50
1.5"  [Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | Bingham & Taylor| No Bid No Bid Clow $23.80 $714.00 Bibby $31.50 $945.00 S 15.72 $471.60
2" Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | Bingham & Taylor| No Bid No Bid Clow $25.05 $751.50 Bibby $34.63 $1,038.90 S 17.17 $515.10
4" Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | Bingham & Taylor| No Bid No Bid Clow $50.09 $1,502.70 Bibby $61.57 $1,847.10 S 36.08 $1,082.40
6" Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | ingham & Taylor] No Bid No Bid Clow $55.10 $1,653.00 Bibby $37.90 $1,137.00 S 48.64 $1,459.20
Main Gate Box Cover: 30 | Bingham & Taylor| No Bid No Bid Clow $33.09 $992.70 Bibby $25.79 $773.70 S 24.27 $728.10
Sub-Total $13,783.60 $12,220.90 $10,634.10
BID GROUP 10
BURY FIRE HYDRANTS ary| Mgai ':'fr UNIT PRICE EX;E\%’EE: 1D L7 ';'fr Partl  ynimerice | exTenoep sio amount M & “:fr Parl  unimerice  |extenpep eib amount] M & “:fr Partl  UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
6'  |OpenRight, 5 %" Hydrant (Red): 10|  Mueller 3,410.00 $34,100.00 AVK 3687 $36,870.00f  Kennedy 3344.9 $33,449.00Q  AFCB84 3950 $39,500.00
5%” |Open Right, 5 %” Hydrant (Red): 10 Mueller 3,338.00 $33,380.00 AVK 3609 $36,090.00 Kennedy 3290.48 $32,904.80 AFC B85 4050 $40,500.00




Awarded sub group category
Mathematical error adjustment
Conditional Bid, must reject

John Hoadley & Sons I Ti-Sales Putnam Pipe E.J. Prescott
BID GROUP 11
SIZE WATERWORKS BRASS ary Mgaf‘t ':'fr UNIT PRICE EX;EI\;‘(SLEE?D Mfr & 'Z'fr Partl  ynimerice | extenoep sio amount | M & ';'fr Partl  yniterice  |extenpep eio amount] M & ':'fr Partl  UnireRicE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
1x%” |Reducer Coupling: 10 No Bid No Bid Midland $7.05 $70.50IN No Bid No Bid McDonald $13.10 $131.00
% |street Elbow: 10 No Bid No Bid Midland $5.68 $56.80 No Bid No Bid McDonald $10.37 $103.70
%" |Elbow - F.I.P. x F.IP. (90°): 20 No Bid No Bid Midland $4.88 $97.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $8.18 $163.60
1" Elbow - F.I.P. x F.I.P. (90°): 20 No Bid No Bid Midland $7.52 $150.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $12.57 $251.40
3% Meter Adaptor (Straight): 40 No Bid No Bid Ford $13.89 $555.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $14.66 $586.40
1" Meter Adaptor (Straight): 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $20.80 $208.00 No Bid No Bid McDonald $22.59 $225.90
% Meter Adaptor (Bent): 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $20.43 $204.30 No Bid No Bid McDonald $14.66 $146.60
1" Meter Adaptor (Bent): 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $29.14 $291.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $22.59 $225.90
%" Meter Adaptor (Short): 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $13.89 $138.90 No Bid No Bid McDonald $14.66 $146.60
1" |Meter Adaptor (Short): 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $21.40 $214.00 No Bid No Bid McDonald $22.59 $225.90
Reduced P Backflow P
g |ecuced Pressure Backilow Freventor | - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Watts $0.00
with Ball Valves:
Reduced P Backflow P
pr [Recuced Pressure Backilow Freventor | - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Watts $0.00
with Ball Valves:
Straight T Ball Valve F.I.P. x F.I.P.
# Wirta.;gHamJZ,e s " 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $53.81 $1,076.20 No Bid No Bid McDonald $84.20 $1,684.00
Straight T Ball Valve F.I.P. x F.I.P.
v Wirt?gHanJZ? T 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $123.47 $2,469.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $127.13 $2,542.60
Straight T Ball Valve Flared x F.I.P.
g [TrelEn Tybe Ball elve Flaredx 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $56.41 $1,128.20 No Bid No Bid McDonald $108.79 $2,175.80
Straight T Ball Valve Flared x F.I.P.
U 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $128.92 $2,578.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $154.67 $3,093.40
” i‘fraighﬂvpe BallValve FLLP. xMeter | No Bid No Bid Ford $93.88 $1,877.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $100.98 $2,019.60
ut with Hande:
I i‘tra'gh”w’e Ballvalve FLLP. xMeter ] 5 No Bid No Bid Ford $137.24 $2,744.80 No Bid No Bid McDonald $146.77 $2,935.40
ut with Hande:
Angle Ball Valve P.J.C. x M N ith
% H2§§|e~a alve PLC.xMeter Nutwith | No Bid No Bid Ford $69.08 $1,381.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $73.61 $1,472.20
Angle Ball Valve P.J.C. x Meter Nut with
o HZi;: alve xVieter Butwith 1 o4 No Bid No Bid Ford $168.83 $3,376.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $142.65 $2,853.00
” 2”;:‘;’ Angle Ball Valve with Handle: 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $129.28 $2,585.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $93.01 $1,860.20
1“22:;* Angle Ball Valve with Handle: 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $168.83 $3,376.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $142.65 $2,853.00
%" Curb Stop Compression: 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $93.38 $1,867.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $93.49 $1,869.80
1” Curb Stop Compression: 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $140.39 $2,807.80 No Bid No Bid McDonald $140.52 $2,810.40
C i C i C.C.
% Tsrrzg;?“on Stop Compression x 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $68.23 $1,364.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $68.28 $1,365.60
p [ooreoration stop Compressionx €G- 54 No Bid No Bid Ford $89.71 $1,794.20 No Bid No Bid McDonald $89.79 $1,795.80
1 [ Aoeprors EComeressom ST oo No Bid No Bid Ford $23.40 $468.00 No Bid No Bid McDonald $25.00 $500.00
I mrfdaptor’ 17~ Compression x 1 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $25.04 $500.80 No Bid No Bid McDonald $25.09 $501.80
%" |Compression Union: 30 No Bid No Bid Ford $25.75 $772.50 No Bid No Bid McDonald $25.78 $773.40
%” x1” |Compression Union: 30 No Bid No Bid Ford $29.92 $897.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $31.94 $958.20
1” Compression Union: 30 No Bid No Bid Ford $29.45 $883.50 No Bid No Bid McDonald $29.48 $884.40
Total Contract Award $74,799.00 $124,044.67 $111,029.95 $105,569.90

Witnessed by: Vincent Roy. Mike Abbondanzio, Karen Moretti




