Sudbury Water District

IFB 27-4
Miscellaneous Waterworks Supplies
Bid Opening: 6/10/2026 @ 10:00 AM

John Hoadley & Son Ti-Sales Ferguson Core & Main
BID GROUP 1
SIZE GATE VALVES Qry Mgai':fr UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNTY V" & ':fr Partl  unirerice | exTenoe Bip amount M & '\:fr Partl  Unirerice  |extenoep sip amount| M & ':fr Partl  UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
., Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open
6 Right, Mueller or approved equal: 4 Mueller $975.00 $3,900.00 AVK $1,058.96 S4,235.84 Kennedy $976.42 $3,905.68 Kennedy $982.76 $3,931.04
., Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open
8 Right, Mueller or approved equal: 4 Mueller $1,554.00 $6,216.00 AVK $1,685.13 $6,740.52 Kennedy $1,555.40 $6,221.60 Kennedy $1,565.50 $6,262.00
\ Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open
10 Right, Mueller or approved equal: 1 Mueller $2,420.00 $2,420.00 AVK $2,627.21 $2,627.21 Kennedy $2,425.37 $2,425.37 Kennedy $2,441.12 $2,441.12
ppr  |Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open 1| Muen $3,060.00 $3,060.00] Ak $3,324.21 $3,324.21] Kenned $3,069.02 $3,069.02] Kenned $3,088.95 $3,088.95
Right, Mueller or approved equal: uetier ¢ ' ’ ’ ’ ’ ¢ ' ennedy ! ' ! ’ ennedy ! ’ ! ’
pgr  |Resitient Wedge Gate Valve, Open 1| Muen $8,919.00 sg919.00]  Awk $11,703.13 $11,703.13]  Kenned $8,144.21 $8,144.21] Kenned $8,197.10 $8,197.10
Right, Mueller or approved equal: uetier ! ' ’ ’ ’ ’ ¢ ' ennedy ! ' ! ’ ennedy ! ’ ! ’
BID GROUP 2
MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT Mfr & Mfr Mfr & Mfr Part Mfr & Mfr Part Mfr & Mfr Part
SIZE PACK EOR D.I. & PVC PIPE QTY Part # UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT| 4 UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT 4 UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT M UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
., Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI . .
6 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 10| Ebaa 2000 $64.00 $640.00 Ford $57.48 S574.80f Star Pipe $54.84 $548.40 Sigma $54.34 $543.40
. Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI . .
8 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 10| Ebaa 2001 $85.25 $852.50 Ford $69.80 $698.00] Star Pipe $74.82 $748.20 Sigma $74.13 $741.30
| Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI . .
10 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 8 Ebaa 2002 $122.00 $976.00 Ford $105.61 $844.88] Star Pipe $105.85 $846.80 Sigma $104.88 $839.04
; Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI . .
12 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 4 Ebaa 2003 $162.00 $648.00 Ford $125.84 $503.36] Star Pipe $142.41 $569.64 Sigma $141.10 $564.40
\ Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI . .
16 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 4 Ebaa 2004 $272.00 $1,088.00 Ford $272.67 $1,090.68] Star Pipe $255.48 $1,021.92 Sigma $253.14 $1,012.56
. Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 . .
6 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 10| Ebaa 2005 $74.00 $740.00 Ford $82.84 $828.40] Star Pipe $63.77 $637.70 Sigma $63.18 $631.80
., Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 . .
8 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bols: 10| Ebaa 2006 $99.00 $990.00 Ford $90.44 $904.40] Star Pipe $85.87 $858.70 Sigma $85.08 $850.80
. Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 . .
10 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 8 Ebaa 2007 $168.00 $1,344.00 Ford $131.30 $1,050.40 Star Pipe $149.63 $1,197.04 Sigma $148.26 $1,186.08
. Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 . .
12 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 4 Ebaa 2008 $177.00 $708.00 Ford $138.16 $552.64 Star Pipe $156.86 $627.44 Sigma $155.42 $621.68
. Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 . .
16 Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts: 4 Ebaa 2009 $340.00 $1,360.00 Ford $381.46 $1,525.84 Star Pipe $323.49 $1,293.96 Sigma $320.53 $1,282.12
SUb-TOtal $91346‘50_ $8,349‘80_ $8,273‘18




John Hoadley & Son Ti-Sales Ferguson Core & Main
BID GROUP 3
SERVICE SADDLES w/ CC
SIZE / qry] Mir&Mfr UNIT PRICE exTeNDED BID AmouNT] VT &MTPartl i price | extenpep sip amount [MFEMITPart o price | exrenpep Bip amount | M EMIFPart] i pRice EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
THREAD Part # # # #
CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, E . .
6'x1" | ervice >addie, Single Strap, EROXY | o |y gy $54.00 $270.00] smith Blair $33.33 $166.65] Smith Blair $29.58 $147.90 NO BID $0.00
oated, Romac or approved equal:
. . lcCservice saddle, Single Strap, Epoxy ) ) . ) . .
8"x 1 Coated, Romac or approved equal: 5 Smith Blair $62.80 $314.00f Smith Blair $39.54 $197.70§ Smith Blair $35.09 $175.45 NO BID $0.00
+ - |CCService Saddle, Single Strap, Epoxy . . . . . .
10"x 1 Coated, Romac or approved equal: 2 Smith Blair S75.75 S$151.50f Smith Blair $43.92 $87.84f Smith Blair $38.97 $77.94 NO BID $0.00
CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, E
10 [ SO R S e Y L 2| smith Blair $88.00 $176.00] Smith Blair $50.80 $101.60f Smith Blair $45.08 $90.16 NO BID $0.00
oated, Romac or approved equal:
ccs Saddle, Single Strap, E
16'x 1" | ervice Saddle, Single Strap, Epoxy Smith Blair $135.00 $135.000 Smith Blair $132.92 $132.920 smith Blair $117.95 $117.95 NO BID $0.00
oated, Romac or approved equal:
Sub-Total $1,046.50_ $686.71 $609.40 $0.00
BID GROUP 4
SIZE POLYETHYLENE (PE) TUBING  |aty Mgai';ffr UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMouNT| VT & ':fr Parl  Unirerice | exTeENDED BID amount | MT& '\:fr Partl  UniTerice  |exTenpep eip amount | M & ':fr Partl  UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
%" |PE Tubing (Per 100' Roll): 2 NO BID Blue Poly $0.67 $134.00 Endot $32.00 $64.00 Endot $0.43 $86.00
PE Tubing (Per 100' Roll): NO BID Blue Poly $1.08 $432.00 Endot $51.00 $204.00 Endot $0.70 $280.00
BID GROUP 5
SIZE DUCTILE IRON PIPE g | D UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BiD AMoUNT] HTT & M UNITPRICE | ExTenDED Bip Amount | T & Mt UNITPRICE  |extenDeD aip amount| M & MIT UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
Part # Part # Part # Part #
6"  |puctile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): [100]  US Pipe $30.65 $3,065.00 NO BID McWane $30.58 $3,058.00] US Pipe $30.67 $3,067.00
8" |Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): [100]  US Pipe $43.25 $4,325.00 NO BID McWane $43.15 $4,315.00]  US Pipe $43.28 $4,328.00
10" Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): | 20 US Pipe $56.70 $1,134.00 NO BID McWane $56.55 $1,131.00 US Pipe $56.73 $1,134.60
12" |Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): | 40| s Pipe $71.40 $2,856.00 NO BID McWane $71.21 $2,848.40] US Pipe $71.43 $2,857.20
16" Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot): US Pipe $103.25 $2,065.00 NO BID McWane $103.05 $2,061.00 US Pipe $103.37 $2,067.40
BID GROUP 6
SIZE POLYVINYL C;;gg)lDE PVCPIPE oy Mgagr‘t'\:fr UNIT PRICE EXTENDED 81D amounT] M & ':fr Partl  yniTericE | exTENDED Bip amounT | M & 'Z'fr Partl  yniterice  |exrenpep eip amount| VT & ":fr Partl  UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
6" C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): 100 NO BID NO BID Westlake $12.60 $1,260.00f National Pipe $11.68 $1,168.00
8" C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): 100 NO BID NO BID Westlake S21.61 $2,161.00f National Pipe $20.48 $2,048.00
10" C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): 80 NO BID NO BID Westlake $32.43 $2,594.40 National Pipe $30.36 $2,428.80
12" C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): 120 NO BID NO BID Westlake S45.69 $5,482.80 National Pipe| S42.79 $5,134.80
16" C-900 Pipe (Per Foot): NO BID NO BID Westlake S64.49 $2,579.60 National Pipe| $63.31 $2,532.40




John Hoadley & Son Ti-Sales Ferguson Core & Main
BID GROUP 7

SIZE REPAIR COUPLING ary M':ai'\:fr UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT, Mfr&';'frpart UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT Mfr&':frpart UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT Mfr&rfrpa” UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with

6" HWO oFt puctie fron ~oupiing wi 10 | Mueller/Hymax $352.00 $3,520.00§ Smith Blair $296.13 $2,961.30] Smith Blair $264.35 $2,643.50 Ford $272.79 $2,727.90
andle, Hymax 2 or equal:
Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with

g" HWO oFt puctie fron ~oupiing wi 10 | Mueller/Hymax $397.00 $3,970.00§ Smith Blair $335.37 $3,353.70] Smith Blair $299.38 $2,993.80 Ford $307.99 $3,079.90
andle, Hymax 2 or equal:
Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with

1 [ o e o e 6 | Mueller/Hymax $510.00 $3,060.00] Smith Blair $464.37 $2,786.22] Smith Blair $414.53 $2,487.18]  Ford $405.33 $2,431.98
andle, Hymax 2 or equal:
Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with

1 [0 O e Ton e 6 | Mueller/Hymax $603.00 $3,618.00] Smith Blair $620.57 $3,723.42] Smith Blair $553.97 $3,323.82 Ford $558.54 $3,351.24
andle, Hymax 2 or equal:
Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with

16 [ O e o e 2 | Mueller/Hymax $1,650.00 $3,300.00] Smith Blair $1,323.15 $2,646.30] Smith Blair $1,181.14 $2,362.28 Ford $1,526.58 $3,053.16
andle, Hymax 2 or equal:

BID GROUP 8

SIZE FULL CIRCLE REAIR CLAMP  |ary M‘:ai':fr UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT| Mfr&':frpart UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT Mfr&'\:frpart UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT Mfr&rfrpan UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

6 ;235 Overall Length, Stainless Steel, | ¢ it pair $113.00 $452.00] smith Blair $134.13 $536.52]  smith Blair $119.74 $478.96]  Ford 5102.74 $410.96
mith-Blair or equal:

g |20 Overelteneth SaniessStecl 6 1 smith giai $132.00 $792.00| Smith Blair $156.35 $938.10f  smith Blair $139.57 $837.42)  Ford 512080 5724.80
mith-Blair or equal:

o |2 Oversliteneth Staniess el 1 smith giai $168.00 $672.00] Smith Blair $179.18 $716.72]  smith Blair $159.95 $639.80)  Ford 3156.91 5627.64
mith-Blair or equal:

1 |20 Overeliteneth StaniessSteel 1 smith gtair $204.00 $816.00] Smith Blair $205.49 $821.96] Smith Blair $183.44 $733.76]  Ford s174.73 5698.92
mith-Blair or equal:

16" éS,Overéll Length, Stainless Steel, 2| smithBiair $297.00 $594.00] Smith Blair $534.33 $1,068.66] smith Blair $476.98 $953.96 Ford $349.60 $699.20
mith-Blair or equal:

6" éS,Overéll Length, Stainless Steel, 4| smith Blair $125.00 $500.00] Smith Blair $156.40 $625.60] smith Blair $139.62 $558.48 Ford $119.92 $479.68
mith-Blair or equal:
15" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, . . . . ) )

8" o . j 6 | Smith Blair $152.00 $912.00f Smith Blair $187.79 $1,126.74] Smith Blair $167.63 $1,005.78 Ford $138.09 $828.54
mith-Blair or equal:
15" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, . . . . ) )

10" o . j 4 | smithBlair $195.00 $780.00f Smith Blair $226.73 $906.92 Smith Blair $202.39 $809.56 Ford $173.60 $694.40
mith-Blair or equal:
15" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, . . . . ) )

PN . ] 4 | smith Blair $232.00 $928.00f Smith Blair $252.06 $1,008.24f  Smith Blair $225.01 $900.04 Ford $197.53 $790.12
mith-Blair or equal:
20" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, . . . . ) )

16" o . j 2 | Smith Blair $434.00 $868.00] Smith Blair $852.92 $1,705.84]  Smith Blair $761.37 $1,522.74 Ford $911.30 $1,822.60
mith-Blair or equal:




John Hoadley & Son Ti-Sales Ferguson Core & Main
BID GROUP 9

size |CURBBOX. XANA;'\LSCEESVALVE BOX 1y M':ai'\:fr UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNTY M & Z'fr Partl  unirerice | exrenpep Bip avount M & 'Z'fr Partl  Unirerice  |extenpep eip amount| M & ';'fr Partl  UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
#7230 [evie stvle curb Box with Centering Rod | 30 [ sngram & Tor $115.00 s34s000] N $67.09 $2,012.70]  Ford $76.59 $2,297.70]  sigma $75.35 $2,260.50
6"  |curb Box (Erie) Extension: 20| General Fdry $17.00 $340.00 BABA $35.40 $708.00 Gavin $21.15 $423.00 Sigma $13.58 $271.60
30" |Stainless-Steel Centering Rod: 30 | Bingham & Taylor| $37.00 $1,110.00 EBR $37.51 $1,125.30 Ford $56.78 $1,703.40 Sigma $28.22 $846.60
g [costironMein Gate Valve Boxwth 1 10 L aingom . oyior $303.00 $3,03000] N $286.43 $2,864.30] Tyler Union $228.70 $2,287.00]  sigma $170.40 $1,704.00
1" |Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | Bingham & Taylor $14.00 $420.00 GBA $23.97 $719.10] Tyler Union $20.41 s612.30]  sigma $11.18 $335.40
1.5"  |Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | Bingham & Taylor| $19.00 $570.00 GBA $22.60 S678.00f Tyler Union $22.96 $688.80 Sigma $14.38 $431.40
2" Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | Bingham & Taylor| $21.00 $630.00 GBA $29.24 S877.20] Tyler Union $25.51 $765.30 Sigma $18.90 $567.00
4" |Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | Bingham & Taylor $53.00 $1,590.00 GBA $58.38 $1,751.40] Tyler Union $51.86 $1,555.80]  sigma $37.81 $1,134.30
6"  |Main Gate Box Extension: 30 | Bingham & Taylor $89.00 $2,670.00 GBA $64.19 $1,925.70f Tyler Union $73.97 $2,219.10 Sigma $41.54 $1,246.20
Main Gate Box Cover: Bingham & Taylor $24.50 $735.00 $33.94 $1,018.20f Tyler Union $18.71 $561.30 Sigma $22.23 $666.90

BID GROUP 10
BURY FIRE HYDRANTS Qry Mgagr‘t':fr UNIT PRICE exTENDED 81D AMounT| M & ':fr Partl  unirprice | extenpep sib amount | M & '\:fr Partl  Unirerice  |extenoep sio amount| M & ';'fr Part]  UNITPRICE | EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
6' Open Right, 5 %” Hydrant (Red): 10 Mueller $3,472.00 $34,720.00 AVK $3,715.05 $37,150.50 Kennedy $3,481.05 $34,810.50 Kennedy $3,412.30 $34,123.00
5%” |OpenRight, 5 %” Hydrant (Red): Mueller $3,399.00 $33,990.00 $3,636.13 $36,361.30 Kennedy $3,407.13 $34,071.30 Kennedy $3,486.32 $34,863.20




Awarded sub group category

| Ti-Sales Ferguson Core & Main
BID GROUP 11
SIZE WATERWORKS BRASS Qry Mgai':fr UNIT PRICE EXTENDED 81D AMounT] V™ & ':fr Partl  ynitprice | exTenpep eib amount | M '\:fr Partl  ynrerice  |extenoe sio amount | M & ':fr Partl  uNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT
1x%" |Reducer Coupling: 10 NO BID XCOUP $10.00 $100.00 Merit $10.56 $105.60 Lee Brass $13.80 $138.00
%" Street Elbow: 10 NO BID XELL $24.00 $240.00 Merit $8.49 $84.90 Lee Brass $11.11 $111.10
% |Elbow - F.I.P. x F.I.P. (90°): 20 NO BID XELL $6.25 $125.00 Ford $25.82 $516.40 Lee Brass $8.54 $170.80
1" Elbow - F.I.P. x F.I.P. (90°): 20 NO BID XELL $9.50 $190.00 Ford $100.05 $2,001.00 Lee Brass $13.16 $263.20
% Meter Adaptor (Straight): 40 NO BID FHC $16.00 $640.00 Ford $13.27 $530.80 Ford $12.39 $495.60
1" Meter Adaptor (Straight): 10 NO BID FHC $24.00 $240.00 Ford $31.87 $318.70 Ford $18.54 $185.40
%" Meter Adaptor (Bent): 10 NO BID FHL $23.00 $230.00 Ford $18.36 $183.60 Ford $19.81 $198.10
1" Meter Adaptor (Bent): 10 NO BID FHL $32.70 $327.00 Ford $26.17 $261.70 Ford $28.25 $282.50
% Meter Adaptor (Short): 10 NO BID FHC $15.75 $157.50 Ford $13.27 $132.70 Ford $12.39 $123.90
1" Meter Adaptor (Short): 10 NO BID FHC $23.50 $235.00 Ford $31.87 $318.70 Ford $18.54 $185.40
s |Reduced Pressure Backflow Preventor -, NO BID NO BID Ford $354.76 $709.52 Ford $868.53 $1,737.06
with Ball Valves:
1 Rgduced Pressu.re Backflow Preventor 5 NO BID NO BID Ford $380.95 $761.90 Ford $1,026.17 32’052.34
with Ball Valves:
Straight Type Ball Valve F.I.P. x F.I.P.
Z e 20 NO BID Ford $60.50 $1,210.00f  Ford $71.63 $1,432.60 Ford §71.12 $1,422.40
Straight Type Ball Valve F.I.P. x F.I.P.
O 20 NO BID Ford $135.00 $2,700.00]  Ford $108.19 $2,163.80 Ford $107.43 $2,148.60
Straight Type Ball Valve Flared x F.I.P.
N 20 NO BID Ford $64.00 $1,280.00 Ford $83.65 $1,673.00 Ford $83.06 $1,661.20
Straight Type Ball Valve Flared x F.I.P.
g [DET ype el e Faredx 20 NO BID Ford $144.60 $2,892.00]  Ford $96.88 $1,937.60 Ford $114.96 $2,299.20
n Straight Type Ball Valve F.I.P. x Meter
% Nut with Hande: A NOBID Ford $106.00 $2,120.00 Ford $84.31 $1,686.20 Ford $83.71 $1,674.20
., Straight Type Ball Valve F.I.P. x Meter
1 Nut with Hande: 20 NO BID Ford $154.00 $3,080.00 Ford $91.46 $1,829.20 Ford $122.38 $2,447.60
Angle Ball Valve P.J.C. x Meter Nut with
N O 1) NO BID Ford $72.00 $1,440.00 Ford $102.96 $2,059.20 Ford $102.23 $2,044.60
1 ﬁgi';f_a” Valve P.J.C.xMeter Nutwith | ) NO BID Ford $189.32 ¢3,786.40  Ford $121.36 $2,427.20 Ford $150.55 $3,011.00
i/i 2/:;;‘3 Angle Ball Valve with Handle: 20 NO BID Ford $133.36 $2,667.200  Wwatts $116.09 $2,321.80 Ford $115.27 $2,305.40
11“2?;;* Angle Ball Valve with Handle: 20 NO BID Ford $174.18 $3,483.60f  watts $121.36 $2,427.20 Ford $150.55 $3,011.00
%7 Curb Stop Compression: 20 NO BID Ford $97.49 $1,949.80 Ford $84.86 $1,697.20 Ford $84.27 $1,685.40
17 |curb Stop Compression: 20 NO BID Ford $146.58 $2,931.60 Ford $127.60 $2,552.00 Ford $126.70 $2,534.00
wr | orperetion stop Compressionx €€ 59 NO BID Ford $71.24 $1,424.80]  Ford $62.02 $1,240.40 Ford $61.58 $1,231.60
r |sreerstion Stop Compressionx € 99 NO BID Ford 593.67 $1,873.40)  Ford $81.54 $1,630.80]  Ford $80.96 $1,619.20
1 EﬂrTlilc;rlAdaptorf 1" Compression X 3/4" -0 NO BID Ford $24.44 $488.80 Ford $21.28 $425.60 Ford $21.13 $422.60
1 ;r?:.c;r?:Adaptorf T - compression X 1 - NO BID Ford $26.14 $522.80 Ford $22.76 $455.20 Ford $22.60 $452.00
%7 Compression Union: 30 NO BID Ford $26.88 $806.40 Ford $23.40 $702.00 Ford §23.24 $697.20
%” x1” |Compression Union: 30 NO BID Ford $31.24 $937.20 Ford $27.20 $816.00 Ford $27.00 $810.00
1” Compression Union: 30 NO BID Ford $30.74 $922.20 Ford $26.76 $802.80 Ford $26.57 $797.10
Total Contract Award $76,024.00 No Award $88,072.58 $31,049.08

Witnessed by: Vincent Roy and Renee Adams

Michael Abbondanzio, Foreman




